

Make a 'Connection' with



The Connection

Newville
First Church of God

January, 2016



THE POWER OF PRAYER



As we enter into a new year, I want to encourage each of us to begin with a renewed (for some maybe a new) focus on the Power of Prayer! Do we do enough to put our complete trust in God, do we spend enough time petitioning God for the things we need as well as the needs of the world **around us, and do we spend enough time . . . “being still before God”** and listening to what He has to say to us?

Prayer is two-way communication with God. It is easy for us to get out of bed in the morning and **“throw out” a quick prayer for the needs for the coming day, but prayer should be much more than that.** When you pray do you:

- Take time to thank and praise God for all he has done for you? That should be fresh in our minds as we just celebrated Christmas, the birth of Jesus. Remember John 3:16, *God gave his one and only Son so that you (and I) could have everlasting life!*
- Prayer is more than spewing out a few words of what we need for the day without considering what it is that God wants for us on this day!
- Know that prayer is more than just asking God for healing for you and for others.
- Know the two-way part to prayer comes to play when in our prayer life we take time to read the Bible and to listen to God. Psalms 46:10 reminds us, **“to be still, and know that I am God”** and Psalm 37:7, **“be still, and wait patiently on Him.”**
- Is your prayer life more about talking and wanting, or waiting and doing?

Entering 2016, I would like us to focus on the great power that comes through prayer. In the New Testament, we find in James 5:16-18, **“The prayer of a righteous man is powerful and effective. Elijah was a man just like us. He prayed earnestly that it would not rain, and it did not rain on the land for three and a half years. Again he prayed, and the heavens gave rain, and the earth produced its crops.”** God most definitely listens to prayers, answers prayers, and moves in response to prayers.

The scriptures teach us much about the power of prayer.

- Philippians 4:6-7 – We are not to be anxious/worry about things, but petition God with your needs.
- Matthew 7:20 – to pray with faith that God will not only hear, but act upon your prayers.
- Psalm 6:9-10 – prayer can overcome enemies of this world.
- And 1 John 5:14-15 – teaches us to have confidence when we approach God, that if we ask anything **“according to his will”**, he will hear us.

Much more could be said about the power of prayer. So in January, I will begin the year on the subject of **prayer in my messages on Sunday mornings, and also, we will continue our special “Nights of Prayer” as we begin 2016 (save the “Night of Prayer” dates found on page 2).**

I pray you will come and invite others to *come to learn more about the power and the effectiveness of prayer in your life*, the life of your marriage, your family, your workplace, and your church.

Praying for you as we enter 2016!

Pastor Wayne

Upcoming “Night of Prayer” Dates:

Sunday, January 10th at 6:30 pm

Sunday, February 21st at 6:30 pm

Sunday, March 13th at 6:30 pm

Sunday, April 10th at 6:30 pm



Dear Church Family,

Thank you so much for your prayers, cards, and expressions of concern for me since I broke my wrist. I also very much appreciate the prayer blanket. Its warmth reminds me of the love of a caring church family. Ron and I are blessed to be part of this fellowship.

In Christian love, Miriam Dull

Dear Church Family,

Thank you so much for the thoughtfulness and Thank you Sue Russell for your visit and beautiful prayer. The fruit basket was a surprise at a time when one was needed to lift my spirits. Surgery and recovery is behind me once again and I praise God for his many blessings and healing during that time. Enclosed is a donation to the Caring Fund to pay forward for others at their time of need. Blessings and thanks to all.

Anna Lehman

Dear Blanket Ministry,

Thank you so much for the lovely warm blanket. I appreciate the accompanying prayers, as well as the time and love that went into the construction of the blanket. It was sometimes difficult to find warm clothing to fit over my cast, and the blanket gave me that extra warmth needed. With God’s healing power and the prayers of the people, I am improving every day. May God richly bless you!

In Christian love, Miriam Dull

Dear Newville Church Family,

I would like to take this opportunity to say that I pray you have a Christmas that overflows with the hope that the Christ Child, Jesus brings us and a New Year full of the assurance of His presence as He carries you (and me) through each and every moment.

Also, as 2015 comes to a close, I want to say THANK YOU to everyone who has “ministered” to me this past year. I may work for the Lord by working for you, but You have ministered to me in so many ways, some in which you will not know fully on this side of eternity. I thank you for all the cards, gifts, words of encouragement, welcoming smiles, but most specifically your prayers. By His grace, I look forward to serving Him, by serving you throughout this new year and beyond.

Christ’s richest blessings upon you, Amy Piper



*We will participate
in the
Ordinance of Communion
on Sunday, January 3rd
during both
Worship Services.*



INSTALLATION OF 2015 CHURCH
COUNCIL
JANUARY 3, 2015
DURING BOTH WORSHIP SERVICES



We are setting up Acolytes for 2016. The task of the acolyte is to light the Altar Candles before the worship service begins. If your child (age 7-12 years old) would like to serve as an acolyte, please place their name and "acolyte" on the communication slip of your bulletin and place it in the offering plate or in the church secretary's mailbox..

Volunteers are needed to help Un-Decorate the church!
Join us on Saturday, January 9th at 9:00 am for our
Christmas Clean Up Day!



The Paw Pack Ministry has been blessed with the participation of several churches and the potential for more the beginning of next year. We have been reaching out to local Businesses, Banks, and Stores for their support.

We recently distributed Welcome Boxes for the kick off to the program **that starts in January. The boxes contained canned vegetables, Pasta's, Bread, Apples and many more items.**

We have several scheduled events to help fulfill our mission. We invite **everyone to participate in our first fun filled event. "Painting for a Purpose"** which will take place on January 23rd at 2:00 pm in the church All Purpose Building with the proceeds going towards the Paw Pack Ministry. The sign-up sheet is available in the Paw Pack display to participate. Money will be collected on the painting day. Deadline to sign up is January 20th. Inclement weather date will be scheduled for Saturday, February 6th.



We want to Thank You and look forward to your continued support.

May the Lord continue to Bless You as you have Blessed this Ministry.



G.I.G.G.L.E.S. Ladies' Lunch Ministry Christmas Luncheon is Tuesday, January 26, 2016 at 12 Noon at Premier Events, Shippensburg. (Carpool from church parking lot at 11:15 am.) Cost is \$14 for a catered meal of: Roast Pork & Apples, Mashed Potatoes and Gravy, California Vegetable Medley, Tossed Salad, Roll and Assorted Pies and Cakes. Payment to Kim Bailey or Jean Sponenberg. Bring a \$5.00 gift for a fun gift exchange. Please sign up by January 17th on the Sign-Up sheet in the Welcome Center.



Come out and support our Bible Quizzers on Sunday, January 17th at 2:00 pm here at our own church. This will be their first District Quiz of the new Quizzing Season.

Christmas Flower Arrangement Description	Item #	
Santa Sleigh in large silver container	1	\$125
Nativity	2	\$100
Santa Sleigh Ladder	3	\$45
Pink Pearl Vase	4	No Bid
Choir Angel	5	No Bid
Snowman Pitcher	6	\$50
Purple Feathers	7	No Bid
Silver Wagon	8	\$15
Large Gold Poinsettias	9	No Bid
Snowman Trio	10	\$50
Peppermint Candy	11	\$20
Electric Lights	12	\$125
Frosted Flowers with Gold Angel	13	\$25
Skating Snowman Couple Base	14	\$20
Gold Snowflake Vase	15	\$20
Burgundy Roses	16	\$15
Pink Poinsettia with Quilted Ball & Bird	17	No Bid
Large Green Base with Angel playing Violin	18	No Bid
Merry Christmas Wreath	19	\$50
Pink and Red Poinsettia Wreath	20	\$25
Ivory Poinsettia Wreath	21	\$50
Silver and White Ornament Wreath	22	\$25
Gold Ornament Wreath	23	No Bid
Silver Star	24	\$15
Red Velvet Poinsettia	25	No Bid
Electric Light in a Glass Globe	26	\$40
Animals watching Church Base	27	\$20
Shades of Purple	28	\$20
Tall Standing Glass Angel	29	\$65

Most of the items that didn't receive a bid were purchased by donations after the auction. A total of \$870.00 was received in the Silent Auction and a total of \$124.00 was received for the Live Pine arrangements, making a total of \$994.00 going to the Building Expansion Fund. Thanks to Don Bowers for his generous donations of all the Christmas Flower and Live Pine arrangements.




Ladies - All Aboard The Bus To Cape May! JUNE 14-16, 2016.
The sign-up sheet is in the Welcome Center. For further information, contact Kim Bailey at 776-5989 or 448-5141 (cell) or email grasshopper125@aol.com .



CAMP YOLIJWA NEWS

(717) 776-5281 www.campyolijwa.org Check out the 2016 schedule! Contact YoliJwa Staff [Buy YoliJwa Gift Certificates](#)
Find schedule of events, forms, brochures, promos & videos. www.Facebook.com/campyolijwa Sign up for the newsletter!

Core Staff Workshop
Are you part of a 'Core Staff' group for one of our YoliJwa camps? If so, mark Feb. 5th on your calendar for this year's Camp Leader's Workshop at DGC.

Camp Counselor?
Over 350 persons are needed each summer as volunteer counselors. Lead 6-7 campers thru the day's activities, lead devotions, keep campers involved in the program. Ages 16 & older. Applications on our website.

CAMP HOPE (June 5-10)
A week designed for intellectually disabled adults. Call Camp for a brochure. Register early - space is limited. Consider counseling! Male & Female counselors are always needed for this rewarding week.



WINTER PICNIC
January 31st
3-7 PM
Games, Open Gym, Winter Sports
Bring a side dish or dessert to share. Meat & drink provided. Join in the spirit & dress for the theme.

Camp Work Day
March 26
9:00 am
Help us prepare Camp for our upcoming season! Lunch will be provided.

FAITHFUL SERVANTS FOR JANUARY

8:30 AM Worship Service

Greeters: Bernie & Marylyn Allen family

Nursery: Marylyn Allen, Cindy Finkenbinder, Roger Woltz

9:30 AM Connection Groups

Nursery: January 3: Marylyn Allen, Emma Shughart
January 10: Elaine Good, Brooke Roberts
January 17: Marylyn Allen, Cindy Finkenbinder
January 24: Elaine Good, Teresa Hockenberry
January 31: Marylyn Allen, Cindy Finkenbinder

10:30 AM Worship Service

Greeters: Don & Vonnie Mowery, Scott & Wendy Bullock, Steve Mixell, Jerry & Phyllis Hershey

Acolyte: Andrew Witter

Toddler Church Helpers: January 3:
January 10:
January 17:
January 24:
January 31:

Nursery: January 3: Stacie Nickel, Rebekah Nickel
January 10: Kathy Biscuit, Kacey Biscuit
January 17: Norma Barrick, Ruth Clark
January 24: Ashley Snyder, Brooke Roberts
January 31: Elaine Good, Emma Shughart

Junior Church Teachers: January 3: Jr. Church Children begin in the sanctuary; Brian & Julie Lay
January 10: Brian & Julie Lay
January 17: Brian & Julie Lay
January 24: Brian & Julie Lay
January 31: Brian & Julie Lay

Wednesday Night Connection Group Nursery: January 6: Elaine Good, Kellene Parthemore
January 13: Judy Greenawalt, Pat Martin
January 20: Roger Woltz, Linda Woltz
January 27: Marylyn Allen, Elaine Good





	<u>Nov 15</u>	<u>Jan - Nov 15</u>	<u>Annual Budget</u>	<u>% Budget</u>
Ordinary Income/Expense				
Income				
General Fund Income				
Building Rental Income	30.00	1,185.00		
Envelopes Income	16,863.00	152,760.76		
Interest on Account	7.96	37.30		
Loose Offering Income	7,781.35	72,200.22		
Miscellaneous Income	2,817.04	10,090.12		
Missions Income	969.00	6,476.00		
Online giving	807.20	8,920.80		
Stamp & Tape Fund Income	4.00	58.00		
Total General Fund Income	<u>29,279.55</u>	<u>251,728.20</u>		
Money Market Income				
Building Fund Income	7,867.00	100,580.38		
CD - Interest	0.00	1,554.66		
Kennedy Camp Fund Income	0.00	1,376.00		
Memorial Fund Income	0.00	1,530.00		
Money Market Interest Account	46.03	280.97		
Total Money Market Income	<u>7,913.03</u>	<u>105,322.01</u>		
Total Income	37,192.58	357,050.21		
Expense				
Total Administration - Other	-459.17	7,740.20	13,300.00	58.20%
Total Administration - Staffing	8,199.53	111,738.73	128,232.70	87.14%
Total Benevolences	3,833.56	47,179.99	58,210.00	81.05%
Total Christian Education	2,495.89	10,024.91	14,500.00	69.14%
Total Church Life Activities	0.00	1,191.68	1,900.00	62.72%
Total Property Management	332.58	27,720.74	35,650.00	77.76%
Total Stewardship & Finance	0.00	1,219.07	1,350.00	90.30%
Total Worship & Evangelism	0.00	1,477.18	3,000.00	49.24%
Total Expense	<u>14,785.09</u>	<u>208,675.20</u>	<u>256,142.70</u>	<u>81.47%</u>

The Church Council will meet on Monday, January 11th at 7:00 pm.

Community Events & Senior Center News is on the Welcome Center bulletin board.

Council Minutes & detailed Financial Report copies are in the Welcome Center.



STORM WATCH & CANCELLATION OF SERVICES - Please listen carefully to the cancellation announcements to see if one or all of the services are being cancelled on a particular day. As always you can call Pastor Wayne at 448-6994 or Buz Anderson at 776-4734. As always, please use sound judgment as to whether or not to attend services during inclement weather. **BE SAFE!**



 www.whtv.com	 www.river973.com	 www.bobradio.com	 www.993kissfm.com
 www.abc27.com	 www.cw15.com	 www.wtan.com	 www.whp580.com

ANNIVERSARIES

Larry & Janet Simon	1/1
Ronald & Shirley McDonald	1/16
George & Norma Barrick	1/19
David & Eileen Parthemore	1/23
Donald & Shirley Heishman	2/3
Larry & Janis Jones	2/18
Jerry & Phyllis Hershey	2/27



Donate your used printer ink cartridges to benefit Pregnancy Ministries Inc. Please place them in the **basket marked "PMI Ink Cartridges" in the Welcome Center.**

Don't forget your Big Spring Area Food Bank Donations. Collection Box is in the Welcome Center. Especially needed are peas and other non-perishable food items.

BIRTHDAYS

Bentley Jackson	1/2	Robert Woltz	2/4
Mary Jones	1/2	Benson Stake	2/4
Betty Lehman	1/3	Elfi Hoskins	2/4
Doug Long	1/4	Abby Stitt	2/4
Paul Spahr	1/4	Lynn Finkenbinder	2/4
Drake File	1/6	Jeanette Frey	2/5
Bruce Conover	1/8	Chuck Markley	2/6
Amanda Weaver	1/8	Pat Shughart	2/7
Chase File	1/9	Wyatt Jones	2/8
Stephanie Wall	1/13	Cherie Darhower	2/8
Cleo Hosler	1/14	Vonnie Lay	2/9
Holly Jones	1/14	Sharon Bitner	2/10
Frances Kennedy	1/15	Steven Lehman	2/10
Kelly Hall	1/15	Zachary Greenawalt	2/10
Levi Forney	1/16	Helen Fisher	2/10
Peggy Coover	1/17	Hailey Fraker	2/11
Andrew Malick	1/18	Joe Carbaugh	2/12
Tony Jackson	1/18	Taylor Coy	2/13
Michael Bobb	1/18	Edward Hall	2/15
Amanda Groff	1/19	Brayden Mentzer	2/18
Abigail Halac	1/21	Dalton Eberts	2/18
Doris Deihl	1/22	Alexis White	2/19
Ruth Clark	1/22	Tanner Greenawalt	2/19
Chip Shughart	1/23	Tom Griffie	2/19
Adelyn Ramsey	1/23	Dillan Hershey	2/19
Isabella White	1/23	Rebekah Nickel	2/19
Braylon Ocker	1/24	Louis Biscuit	2/21
Michael Frantz	1/24	Lisa Baer	2/21
Roger Woltz	1/26	Mark Long	2/21
Richard Daihl	1/26	Richard Shriner	2/21
Pat Martin	1/28	Ann Peters	2/21
Ian Lay	1/28	Zach Reed	2/23
Bethany Clark	1/29	Linda Martin	2/25
Steve Brown	1/29	Stacie Nickel	2/25
Rachel Newswanger	1/31	Bradley Lay	2/26
Barb Hoover	1/31	Danielle Reed	2/27



*We extend our Christian love, prayers, and sincere sympathy to **Kellene Parthemore and family in the death of Kellene's Father.***



1. Pray that New Year's celebrations will be done safely with no wrecks, violence or other accidents.
2. Praise God for this new year with a horizon of opportunities to do our best for Him. How will you use them?
3. Pray for those dealing with depression. The glow of the holidays is past and if our focus is not on the warmth of God's love, it can be quite a letdown.
4. Pray for Pastor Wayne, Elaine and their family. We are thankful that God chose them to lead our congregation. Pray they will be blessed with good health and safety in all areas. Likewise, pray for the other pastors of our church and their families.
5. Pray for your family members, especially the unsaved ones. But be grateful for each one.
6. Praise God for the music and choirs in our church. From the small children to the adult choir, other duets and solos here and there. Each one using their talents to praise God is a huge blessing to us all.
7. Pray for people who are single and lonely. Some people are happy to live alone, but for the others, pray they will find a Godly spouse or someone else to share their days with.
8. Pray for all the men and boys in our church, that each one will be healthy and grow in their love for Jesus.
9. Pray that when there are icy, snowy road conditions, people will be very careful this winter so there are no falls, wrecks or serious injuries.
10. Praise God for making YOU. Each one is unique, made with a specific mission in God's plan. Only you can fulfill your part. YOU are special!
11. Pray for our church council as they meet to take care of running our church. Pray that every word spoken will be in kindness and thought out before speaking.
12. Pray for those that are sledding, skiing, etc. that they will stay in control and be safe.
13. Pray for the families/caregivers involved in taking care of special needs individuals, that they can find answers and resources to make things easier for all involved. Praise God there is support from others who understand what a blessing these children are.
14. Pray for all who live with chronic pain, for some relief and courage to deal with it.
15. Pray for people who physically or mentally abuse others, that their eyes will be forced open to the pain they cause others and they get help to end the meanness and persecution permanently.
16. Pray for those being abused, whether physically, verbally or emotionally. Pray they will find strength and a way to escape the abuse, someone to help them.
17. Pray for those dealing with unexpected pregnancies, that they will understand how precious these lives really are and give birth at term, safely. Pray they will choose life.
18. Praise God for His wonderful imagination, to create so many millions of beings and have each one be different in some way is amazing.
19. Pray for those having chemo, dialysis, radiation or other treatments, that the procedure will not make them sick, but be effective.
20. Pray for those who live in areas where there is a lot of violence, that they will be kept safe and peace will take over.
21. Pray for those in the world with no source of clean water. We take it for granted, yet it can mean the difference between life and death.
22. Pray for those who have put their faith in Jesus, but are having or doubts, that they can see just how real He is in their lives. Pray also for those who are being persecuted for their faith in Jesus. The problem is spreading and many are being murdered because they proclaim Him to be their Lord.
23. Pray that we are not quite so quick to judge others. Sometimes words and tone of voice may not be meant as we perceive them. There can be circumstances we do not see or know about. Feelings get hurt and walls are built up by what might have been done unintentionally. Don't let a wound become infected by a misunderstanding unresolved.
24. Praise God for the Gathering and the difference it has made in so many lives. For upcoming generations, even. Praise God for Kelly and Kris Hall listening to the Holy Spirit in starting this group. Even those who had formerly vowed not to set foot in a church are being changed and developing a relationship with Jesus. There are serving opportunities for anyone who feels called to get involved. Just ask them how.
25. How are your relationships with your spouse? Family? Close friends? Is it all you would like it to be? How about praying for them specifically every day and maybe speaking a blessing to them? Why not try it and see how things have changed by this time 6 months from now?
26. Praise God for those who do jobs in our church, that we take for granted. From those that run the sound system, do the bulletins/newsletters, plant and weed flowers, mow, snow removal, cleaning to name a few. They do it for God's glory, not their own. Pray they will receive a special blessing.
27. Pray for those who have to work outside or are homeless, that they will find some warmth and not get frostbite.
28. Pray for those awaiting organ transplants, that they can hold on long enough, as well as for the donors and their families (that they know Christ).
29. Pray for all the women and girls of our church, for good health and safety as they strive to live their lives for God's glory.
30. Pray for those who feel "that their luck will never change", that it's all hopeless. Pray they will recognize God's power and control in their lives, that everything does work together in the end.
31. Today is Stamp Sunday. There are many outreach ministries you can choose from that don't require a lot of money. A few stamps, praying, encouraging others, a phone call or card all mean more than you realize. They are great ways to serve God. Pray these ministries will all win others to Christ as He uses your efforts.



January 2016

Sun	Mon	Tue	Wed	Thu	Fri	Sat
					1 	2 8:00 am Men's Prayer
3 Family Sunday Church Council Installation 8:30 am Worship Service 9:30 am Connection Groups 10:30 am Worship Service	4 6:00 pm Karate School 6:30 pm Teen Bible Study 7:00 pm Trustee Meeting	5 6:00 pm PAW Packs Meeting 7:00 pm Cub Scouts	6 6:00 pm Adult Choir Practice 7:00 pm Connection Groups 7:00 pm Kidz Choir Practice and Promise Kidz	7 6:00 pm Karate School	8 WINTER JAM BUS TRIP & CONCERT	9 8:00 am Men's Prayer 9:00 am Christmas Clean Up Day?
10 8:30 am Worship Service 9:30 am Connection Groups 10:30 am Worship Service 5:15 pm Bible Quiz Practice 6:30 pm Prayer Service	11 6:00 pm Karate School 6:00 pm Elders Meeting 7:00 pm Church Council Meeting	12 7:00 pm Cub Scouts	13 6:00 pm Adult Choir Practice 7:00 pm Connection Groups 7:00 pm Kidz Choir Practice and Promise Kidz	14 6:00 pm Karate School	15	16 8:00 am Men's Prayer
17 8:30 am Worship Service 9:30 am Connection Groups 10:30 am Worship Service 2:00 pm Bible Quiz Here	18 Martin Luther King Jr. Day 6:00 pm Karate School 6:30 pm Teen Bible Study Meeting	19 7:00 pm Cub Scouts	20 6:00 pm Adult Choir Practice 7:00 pm Connection Groups 7:00 pm Kidz Choir Practice and Promise Kidz	21 6:00 pm Karate School	22	23 8:00 am Men's Prayer 2:00 pm Paint for a Purpose
24 8:30 am Worship Service 9:30 am Connection Groups 10:30 am Worship Service 12 Noon Children's Ministry Luncheon & Meeting 5:15 pm Bible Quiz Practice	25 6:00 pm Karate School	26 GIGGLES Ladies Lunch Ministry 7:00 pm Cub Scouts	27 6:00 pm Adult Choir Practice 7:00 pm Connection Groups 7:00 pm Kidz Choir Practice and Promise Kidz	28 6:00 pm Karate School	29	30 8:00 am Men's Prayer COUNCIL RETREAT
31 Building Fund Sunday Stamp Sunday 8:30 am Worship Service 9:30 am Connection Groups 10:30 am Worship Service 5:15 pm Bible Quiz Practice						



Newville First Church of God
 475 Shippensburg Road
 Newville, PA 17241
 E-mail: secretary@newvillecog.com
 Website: www.newvillecog.com

Postage
 Required



Newville First Church of God

717- 776- 5223

The Newville First Church of God exists to exalt God by showing His love through the fellowship of believers for the purpose of making more and better disciples.

UPCOMING EVENT

- 1/1 HAPPY NEW YEAR!
- 1/2 Men's Prayer meets each Saturday at 8:00 am
- 1/3 Family Sunday, Communion, Church Council Installation
- 1/4 Karate School meets each Monday & Thursday at 6:00 pm, Teen Bible Study, Trustee Meeting
- 1/5 Cub Scouts meet each Tuesday at 7:00 pm, PAW Packs Ministry Meeting
- 1/8 WINTER JAM CONERT
- 1/9 Christmas Clean-Up Day at 9:00 am
- 1/10 Bible Quiz Practice at 5:15 pm, Night of Prayer at 6:30 pm
- 1/11 Elders Meeting at 6:00 pm, Church Council Meeting at 7:00 pm
- 1/17 District Bible Quiz at 2:00 pm here at our church
- 1/18 Martin Luther King, Jr. Day, Teen Bible Study
- 1/23 "Paint for a Purpose" at 2:00 pm
- 1/24 Children's Ministry Luncheon Meeting at 12 Noon, Bible Quiz Practice at 5:15 pm
- 1/26 GIGGLES Ladies Lunch Ministry meeting at Premier Events for Christmas Luncheon
- 1/30 Church Council Retreat
- 1/31 Stamp Sunday, Building Fund Sunday, Bible Quiz Practice at 5:15 pm



Join us each Wednesday at 6:00 pm for Adult Choir Practice and at 7:00 pm for Connection Groups, Kidz Choir and Promise Kidz

Worship Service

8:30 am

Nursery Care

Ages under 2

Connection Groups

9:30 am

Adult Electives

lecture or discussion

Children's Classes

Nursery thru High School

Post High School Classes

Worship Service

10:30 am

Junior Church

1st - 5th grade

Children's Church

Ages 2 - Kindergarten

Nursery Care

Ages under 2